Buyer: Julie Schiltz

5762 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/15/18

H* Expanded Shale Sl (e Westover lF;(;ck & Sand,
[}

c

- Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price Ex;e;'ir::deed
1 E;EEEEF;ngEDYi:ADLE 34X 48 665 CY | $ 5260($ 34,979.00( $ 55.10( $ 36,641.50
2 g#YEéZg;DED SHALE 3/4 X #8 DAVID 600 CY | $ 56.60| $ 33,960.00( $ 59.40( $ 35,640.00
3 |00 N ICT BANDS MPIOG | 1S00| CV |8 4960)'S 7440000 s
* |Sow CT 4ANDSO MPIED | 2000| CY |8 4870|'s 9:40000 s
S |o1 P 65 3 £ OLwiLBER | ©500| OV |8 5420| s 35230000 s
© |12 WP 15 ami W OF wMORE | 2000| Y |'$ 5060|  101.20000 s -
7 |5 P 3 £ OF DORCHESTER | 2500| OV |'$ S060| S 14150000 s
® |15 P 2441 S OF WESTERN | 3000| OV |'$ S370| S 16110000 s
9 |15 P 10 1M1 N OF FAIRBURY | LSO0| OV |8 S310|'s  78.650.00 s -
10 5;/:\'-/532(4P.'JA(I:\ITD]_EA?\]Sgﬁ;hE/llgngxLﬁf\BNOOD 1,000 CY [$ 51.00($ 51,000.00($ 53.80| $ 53,800.00
11 [S)-YlR'EA\)éF:JASI\IIEDEERSDH:VLVEYSS/g;(/IS/Sg 1,000 CY [$ 49.85($ 49,850.00( $ 53.10| $ 53,100.00
12 g;_l]:YE)Y('ZgI;DED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 FALLS a00| oy |$ 4800|$  19.200.00 A ]
13|75 Wb 3 7M1 S OF DAWSON - | 1900| CY |8 4860| 5 94:24000 s
14 5@5§1PQ§?2EGD1817§$F ESfL>E(s|#(28N 2000| CY | $ 61.60| $ 123,200.00 $ -
15| wyap P36 11 £ OF wabison | 1000 CY |8 60208 6020000 s -
16| izt w1 N OF BATTLE creex | 1200 CY |$ 6L15)S 7338000 s -
17| wvars JCTs7 SN OF StanTon | 2200 CY |'$ 50| § 13112000 s -
18 ngEFf;PSA,\I,\:lDNEVB (S)';ASLTEAi/%(N#S AWY 1 1s500| cv |$ 59.60| 3 89,400.00 $ ]
19 E;,“LE;‘QQSEYE\SQALE 3la X #8 2,000 cY | $ 60.25|$ 120,500.00 $ ]
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" Expanded Shale Buildex Inc Westover lF::;.Ck & Sand,
g

- Description Qty [UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price Exl;c)erir::deed
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Buyer: Julie Schiltz

Department of Transportation

5762 OF

Opening Date: 2/15/18

" Expanded Shale Buildex Inc Westover lF::;Ck & Sand,

i .

5 Extended

- Description Qty |UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price XPrice
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 .

39| WY183 MP120 5MI N OF SARGENT 1,270} CY | NoBid $ -
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 .

40| OGALLALA YARD 307 EAST D SOUTH | #000| CY | NoBid $ ;
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 .

41| OGALLALA JCT26/61/30 AIRPORT 1,500 CY | NoBid $ ;
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 )

42| 4WY26 MP136 11MI NW OGALLALA 500 CY | NoBid $ ”
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 )

43|BIG SPRINGS YARD 114 FRONTAGE 255001 CY | NoBid $ ”
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 )

44| GOTHENBURG SITE HWY47 MP61 1,250) CY | NoBid $ ;
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 )

45 | VERTON YARD 1,250| cy | No Bid $ -
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 2 )

461MP 183 2MI W OF MULLEN 2,700| CY | NoBid $ ”
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 )

47|STAPLETON YARD HWY 83 MP 112 1,100} CY | NoBid $ ”
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 2 )

48 |MP 144 2MI W OF HYANNIS 1,300 CY | NoBid $ ”
D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 )

49 MULLEN YARD 1,000| CY No Bid $ -
D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY6 .

50|MP181 E EDGE OF MINDEN 1,500) CY | NoBid $ ”
D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 .

511w Y83 MP44 26MI N OF MCCOOK 1,200 CY | NoBid $ ”
D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY6 .

52|MP42 1/2MI W OF WAUNETA 1,800 CY | NoBid $ ”

53 [D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

54 |D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

55 [D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

56 |D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

57 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

58 [D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

59 [D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

60 |D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

61 |D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -

62 |D-2 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200|] CY | NoBid $ -
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Buyer: Julie Schiltz

5762 OF
Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 2/15/18

" Expanded Shale Buildex Inc Westover lF::;Ck & Sand,
g
- Description Qty [UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price |Unit Price Ex;erir::deed
63 [D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200] CY No Bid $ -
64 [D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200] CY No Bid $ -
65 [D-5 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200] CY No Bid $ -
66 [D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200] CY No Bid $ -
67 [D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200] CY No Bid $ -
68 [D-8 EXPANDED SHALE 1/4 X 1/8 200] CY No Bid $ -
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD MILE .
69 FOR ADD/ALT DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200 CY No Bid $ i
Total $1,037.55] $1,890,579.00| $221.40( $179,181.50
Payment Terms 100 - 30
Delivery Days ARO AS ORDERED
VI.J.1.a. March to November [VI.J.1.a. Oct. to Feb.
b. By the end of the Contract
Comments Pgri_od . .
Bid is for material delivered
in end dump trailers

Invalid Bid

No Bids

TRNLWB LLC DBA Trinity
Lightweight - Vendor did not
sign ITB
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K4 Trucking LLC

Line 69 is NOT included
in bid total
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